SN DESCRIPTION MINIMUM PRICE HIGHEST BID
1 1 LOT OF 4 KITCHEN BENCH 20,592 61,200
2 1LOT OF 2 FREEZERS (PARTS MISSING FOR ONE FREEZER) 8,580 25,160
3 1LOT OF 2 ICE MAKING MACHINE (1 UNASSEMBLED) 10,296 22,100
4 1 LOT OF 2 ELECTRIC ICE CREAM MACHINE (RUSTY AND PARTLY DAMAGED) 8,580 25,100
5 1 SOUTHSTAR ELECTRIC CONVECTION OVEN ( DOOR HANDLE BROKEN) 3,432 10,000
6 1 SOUTHSTAR ELECTRIC OVEN FILM BAKER (RUSTY) 3,003 16,100
7 1 ELECTRIC STEAMER 4,290 10,600
8 1 LOT OF 3 ELECTRIC PLATE TROLLEY DOUBLE 3,861 8,000
9 1 LOT OF 2 GAS FRYER 4,290 11,100
10 1 LOT OF TWO (2) ELECTRIC UNIVERSAL FRITTER 3,432 10,687
11 1 STOVE WOK GAS / ELECTRIC 4,290 9,750
12 1 LOT OF 3 ELECTRIC BBQ STOVE (PARTS MISSING) 2,145 3,540
13 1 LOT OF 2 WS65 + 5 WS105 ELECTRIC ROUND COOLERS 6,006 12,100
14 LOT OF 120 BALES CONTAINING SCARVES(APPROX. 600 PCS PER BALE) 190,080 NO BID RECEIVED
15 LOT OF 114 BALES CONTAINING SCARVES(APPROX. 600 PCS PER BALE) 180,576 NO BID RECEIVED
16 1 METAL( INNER CERAMIC) STOVE (SLIGHTLY BUMPED AND RUSTY) 1,716 4,000
17 1LOT OF TWO (2) BAR CHILLERS 5,148 9,100
18 ONE (1) ELECTRIC OVEN (RUSTY & PARTS MISSING) 2,145 2,155
19 1 LOT OF TWO (2) GAS 6 BURNER NOODLE RANGE 5,148 7,500
20 1 LOT OF 3 GAS RICE STEAMER (ONE SLIGHTLY BUMPED) 4,290 8,500
21 1 ELECTRIC VACUUM PACKING MACHINE 3,300 6,500
22 1 LOT OF 50 ATX CASE 8609 SL/BLUE 12,870 NO BID RECEIVED
23 1 LOT OF 25 MID ATX CASE WITH K/B 4,290 NO BID RECEIVED
24 1LOT OF 9 CTNS X 13 ATX POWER SUPPLY P4 10,039 NO BID RECEIVED
25 1 LOT OF 42 CTNS X 20 PRS BEACH SHOES (ASSORTED COLOURS) 36,036 45,000
26 1 LOT OF 64 1100 W SYST SPEAKERS 32,947 41,239
27 1LOT OF 15 1200 W REMO SPEAKERS 9,009 13,539
28 1 LOT OF 10 1200W SET SPEAKERS 6,006 10,539
29 1 LOT OF 340 CTNS X 12 SET OF 1 GLASS ICE CREAM CUP 44,297 50,533
30 1LOT OF 138 CTNS X 12 SET OF 2 GLASS ICE CREAM CUP 35,958 45,000
31 1 LOT OF 258 MEN'S SHORT 20,859 27,000
32 1LOT OF 284 CERAMIC CUPS + 277 SAUCER 12,334 NO BID RECEIVED
33 1 LOT OF 65 CRAB CRACKER 5,577 7,500
34 1 LOT OF 24 GLASS PLATES LUMINARC 651 1,400
35 1 LOT OF 24 CERAMIC WARE 1,042 1,509
36 1 LOT OF 88 CERAMIC PLATES 3,822 5,500
37 1LOT OF 21 ASSORTED SKIMMER 901 2,301
38 1 LOT OF 168 CERAMIC PLATE REF 10436 6,384 8,013
39 1 LOT OF 144 CERAMIC PLATES 5,472 6,500
40 1 LOT OF 8 PLASTIC MAT 174 359
41 1 LOT OF 8 WOOD SPATULAS 130 315
42 1 LOT OF 2 PIZZA SLICER 43 300
43 1 LOT OF 30 CERAMIC PLATES 1,140 1,489
44 1 LOT OF 2 GRATER 43 200
45 1 FRUIT SLICER 343 450
46 1 CENTRIFUGEUSE 4,290 7,601
47 WINE DISPENSER 2,145 6,200
48 1 LOT OF 3 STAINLESS STEEL KITCHEN USTENSILS (MARMITE) 326 6,501
49 1 LOT OF 2 TROLLEY PLASTIC BASIN 515 1,827
50 1 SHAWARMA / KEBAB MACHINE (RUSTY) 1,716 6,300
51 ONE ELECTRIC WRAPPING SEALER 330 2,320
52 STAINLESS STEEL DISPLAY STAND WITH FOUR GLASS CONTAINERS 1,313 3,650
53 1LOT OF 3 ELECTRIC SMALL GRILL (RUSTY) 1,287 3,200
54 1 STAINLESS STEEL ELECTRIC FONDUE FONTAINE 515 3,500
55 1 LOT OF 50 STAINLESS STEEL SMALL STAND 3,940 4,500
56 1 LOT OF 2 ELECTRIC LARGE GRILL (RUSTY) 1,201 7,900
57 1 STAINLESS STEEL PLATE CHAMPAGNE 109 655
58 1 (1) STAINLESS STEELTOMATO CUTTER 515 700
59 1 LOT OF EIGHT (8) STAINLESS STEEL LID & SIX (6) STAINLESS STEEL TRAY 1,629 6,029
60 1 LOT OF FIVE (5) STAINLESS STEEL TRAY 1,629 3,600
61 1LOT OF TWO (2) ELECTRIC FOOD MIXER 8,580 13,069
62 1LOT OF TWO (2) MELON AND FRUIT CUTTER 6,864 25,786
63 1 (1) ELECTRIC PLATE 2,574 3,662
64 1 MICROWAVE OVEN 2,145 4,500
65 1 LOT OF 108 STAINLESS STEEL FRY SKIMMERS 2,317 5,514

66 1 LOT OF 20 STAINLESS STEEL SMALL STAND 657 1,500



67 1 STAINLESS STEEL TWO BOWL STAND
68 1 LOT OF 18 STAINLESS STEEL ICE BUCKET
69 1 LOT OF FOUR (4) STAINLESS STEEL CHAFING DISC
70 1 LOT OF THREE (3) ELECTRIC ROLLER HOT DOG WARMER
71 1 LOT OF THREE (3) GAS CREPE MAKER
72 1 LOT OF THREE (3) ELECTRIC GRILL
73 1 STAINLESS STEEL SINK
74 1 STAINLESS STEEL SINK(RUSTY)
75 1 LOT OF THREE (3) STAINLESS STEEL SINK
76 1 LOT OF 13 STAINLESS STEEL STAND (ONE BROKEN)
77 1LOT OF 2 STAINLESS STEEL STOOL
78 1 LOT OF 31 ASSORTED MODELS STAINLESS STEEL CHAIR (TWO BROKEN)
79 1 LOT OF 12 TABLE PLASTIC TOP + 13 ROUND PLASTIC TABLE
80 1 STAINLESS STEEL TABLE
81 1 TROLLEY 2 TIER STAINLESS STEEL
82 1 LOT OF SIX (6) STAINLESS STEEL STAND TERAMO
83 1 ELECTRIC BAKING OVEN
84 1 LOT OF 3 STAINLESS STEEL TABLES + STAND
85 1 LOT OF NINE (9) STAINLESS STEEL TRAY AND TEN (10) METAL SUPPORT
86 1 ELECTRIC POTATO PEELER
87 1LOT OF 4 BABY CARRIAGE
88 1 BABY SEAT + 1 ACCESSORY
89 1 LOT OF 3 E SCOOTER ELECTRIC
90 1 LOT OF 33 PANTIES
91 1 LOT OF 22 BOXER
92 1 CHEESE SLICER CERAMICWARE
93 1 LOT OF 26 LADIES DRESS
94 1 LOT OF 11 LADIES BLOUSES
95 1 WHITE WATCH ICE
96 1 USED PINK CAMERA NIKKON
97 1 USED AMAZON KINDLE MODEL D00901
98 1 USED AMAZON KINDLE
99 1 LOT OF THIRTY (30)TABLET POUCH
100 1 USED LAPTOP LENOVO
101 USED IPAD 16 GB
102 USED IPAD A1416 32GB W/O ACC
103 USED IPAD A1395 16GB W/O ACC SCREEN BROKEN/SCRATCH
104 USED IPAD A1460 W/O ACC
105 USED IPAD A1219 16GB W/0O ACC
106 USED IPAD A1455 W/O ACC
107 USED SAMSUNG TABLET GTP3110
108 USED IPAD A1458 W/O ACC
109 USED TABLET ASUS NEXUS W/O ACCESSORIES
110 USED MACBOOK PRO A1278 W/O ACCS
111 1 USED KINDLE AMAZON
112 1 PC KEYPAD FOR TABLETTE
113 USED NOKIA 6700C-1
114 USED NOKIA 101
115 USED NOKIA 305
116 USED ALCATEL 813F
117 USED NOKIA 1202/2
118 USED NOKIA 100
119 1 USED MOBILE PH1 SAMSUNG GT-S5360
120 BLACK BERRY 9700 - (SCRATCHED)
121 USED BLACKBERRY 9360
122 USED NOKIA RM-414
123 USED ALCATEL 292
124 1 MOBILE PH1,MAKE"SAMSUNG GT-55360"
125 USED NOKIA X2-00
126 SAMSUNG GT-19000
127 USED NOKIA 1680C-2
128 1 MOBILE PH1,MAKE"NOKIA 2220S"
129 USED BLACKBERRY 9360
130 MOBILE PH1 NOKIA 6300
131 USED MOBILE PH1 NOKIA 112
132 NOKIA C1-00
133 USED IPOD
134 USED NOKIA 1800
135 USED NOKIA 6303CI

657
3,909
8,686
3,861
5,148
5,148
2,574
2,145
2,059
7,880
1,576

13,299
11,952
3,940
3,257
3,940
6,864
4,728
4,343
8,580
1,030

429
2,059

283

378

217
2,325

889

172

858

343

343
1,287
4,290
4,125
3,300
1,389
6,600
4,950
4,950
6,600
4,950
6,600
6,600

343

429

257

257

343

515

257

257

601

429

686

515

257

858

343

858

257

515

686

343

429

257

515

172

257

1,000
6,300
26,207
5,600
7,200
11,001
4,444
3,700
3,500
9,080
3,600
21,173
20,000
5,001
3,700
6,900
7,800
7,701
5,601
9,879
1,501
600
6,000
525
551
400
3,505
1,260
500
2,227
700
750
NO BID RECEIVED

6,300
6,200
6,500
2,643
8,501
7,200
6,500
7,100
9,100
7,500
12,501
5,200
8,690
550
500
1,000
700
460
475
999
1,001
1,100
1,100
400
1,500
1,008
1,550
351
1,100
1,977
525
929
460
1,500
652
448



136
137
138
139
140
141
142
143
144
145
146
147
148
149
150
151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158
159
160
161
162
163
164
165
166
167
168
169
170
171
172
173
174
175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182
183
184
185
186
187
188
189
191
192
193
194
195
196
197
198
199

200 253 MOBILE SCREENS , 255 SCREEN PROTECTORS , 210 FLEX CABLES

201
202
203
204
205

USED NOKIA C2-01

USED NOKIA 6300 W/O BATTERY

USED SAMSUNG GT-E 1080 W

USED NOKIA 7100S-2

USED MOBILE PH1 NOKIA 16 16-2

USED MOBILE PH1 NOKIA C2-03

USED SAMSUNG MOBILE PH1 GT-1819014

USED SAMSUNG MOBILE PH1 MODEL SGH-E250V
USED MOBILE PH1 GREY COLOR NOKIA 100

USED MOBILE PH1 SAMSUNG SGHIS00

USED MOBILE PH1 SAMSUNG GT-57562

USED PH1 MAKE SAMSUNG WHITE COLOR GTS6500
USED MOBILE PH1 MAKE LG GS107

USED MOBILE PHONE LG KS360

USED MOBILE PHONE LG BL20

USED SONY ERICSSON W100lI

1 LOT OF 2 USED SONY ERICSSON W595S, 73201
USED MOBILE PHONE SAMSUNG GTE1080

USED MOBILE PHONE ALCATEL TOUCH 810
USED MOBILE PHONE ALCATEL 1 TOUCH 308
MOBILE PHONE ALCATEL 1 TOUCH 918

MOBILE PHONE ALCATEL 1 TOUCH 991

USED MOBILE PHONE HUAWEI U 8185-1 V4.5 ( W/O ACC)
USED MOBILE PHONE HUAWEI U 8185-1 V4.5
USED MOBILE PHONE ALCATEL MOBILE PHONE
USED MOBILE PHONE E 71 -1

ONE USED MOBILE PHONE NOKIA

ONE USED MOBILE PHONE LG

ONE USED MOBILE PHONE BLACKBERRY

ONE USED MOBILE PHONE LG

1 CAMERA ,MAKE"NIKON" WITH POUCH

1 LOT OF 6 MONITOR 17" TFT BITSON

1 LOT OF 26 OPTICAL MOUSE PS2

1 BLACK BAG

1 PCE EAU DE TOILETTE"BULGARI"

1 PCE SCENT"DIOR"

1 UNIT BODY MILK"ROSE 4 REINES"

1 LOT OF 4 PAIRS OF EARRINGS

1 UNIT VERNIS

1 LOT OF 2 SETS OF BRACELETS

1 DECORATIVE ELEPHANT SHAPE

1 LOT OF 2 PERFUME

1 WATCH "STUDIO"

1 USED CAMERA MAKE"CANON"

1 LOT OF 2 PCS LENSES

1 LOT OF 4 RAFFIA PURSES

1 LOT OF 2 BASKETS

1 METAL SHELF

1 DIGITAL VIDEO RECORDER AND 1 LOT OF SPARE PARTS.
1 LOT OF IRRIGATION NOZZLES

1.1 COMPLETE SET ALCATEL CONFERENCE PH1 1800RU.
PARTS OF TEXTILE MACHINERY

1 LOT OF 6 SMART HOME GATEWAY IMEI 351732050822355
UN LECTEUR DE CARTES

1 SOLAR LED LIGHT WITH BLUETOOTH

1 REMOTE CONTROL FOR K1 CRANES

FOUR PAIRS OF REINFORCED WHEELS VALOR

1 DRESS

1 LOT OF 3 ELECTRICAL ITEMS

LOT OF DENTAL MATERIAL

FLOWMETER SIEMENS

USED ELECTRIC STEINFURTH APPARATUS

1 LOT OF 20 ASSORTED CISCO SWITCH

1 BLENDER ATTACHMENT + 1 MODIFIED CONTROL MODULE
USED KINDLE

1 USED PINK NINTENDO WITHOUT ACCS

1 NINTENDO DS + ACCESSORIES

BATTERY CHARGER - YIFINE - 24 VOLT

172
257
343
429
172
429
858
257
257
343
686
1,201
257
1,287
429
343
429
257
429
472
472
472
343
343
429
343
515
515
858
429
858
5,148
558
172
515
515
257
86
51
43
69
515
129
858
343
86
51
215
686
64
1,030
172
1,716
172
686
86
172
69
558
20,805
1,076
866
20,216
3,896
48
181
136
181
227

310
400
500
550
500
1,111
2,000
900
351
1,000
1,686
3,400
350
1,500
1,001
601
1,155
310
800
555
800
1,200
900
725
1,000
915
750
755
1,200
1,000
2,777
7,052
1,000
301
1,727
1,727
448
300
225
99
159
808
520
2,155
NO BID RECEIVED
155
250
500
2,686
1,009
2,800
4,591
2,000
239
1,800
106
206
158
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED
1,900
2,300
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED
153
500
650
650
1,900



206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213
214
215
216
217
218

USED MP3 PLAYER

USED CAMERA CANON

USED CAMERA CANON

USED CAMERA SAMSUNG

USED CAMERA KODAK

USED CAMERA SAMSUNG

USED CAMERA SONY CYBERSHOT
USED SEAGATE HARD DISK 500 GB
USED NINA RICI SPECTACLES

LOT OF 60 PCS BRUSH BRISTLES
MV INTERIOR LAMP COVER

LOT OF 6 PCS M/V SPARE PARTS-CLUTCH COVER
LOT OF 3 PCS COUPLING

219 CARTE DE PUISSANCE ( MOTHERBOARD )
220 TRANSFORMER

221
222

223
224

LOT OF 2 AIR PIPES
ELECTRONIC PART

LOT OF : 1 PIVOT SUPPORT, 2 SET CLUTCH , 1 ENGINE SUPPORT, 1 PLASTIC COVER
LOT OF 10 ELECTRICAL BOX

225 ONE MOTOR BLOC 2M 2008 W1655A POOL

226
227
228
229
230
231
232
233

LOT OF 60 PCS ASSORTED SILICON GASKET FOR FRIDGE
LOT OF 3 PCS MACHINERY SPARE PARTS

LOT OF 28 LEGGING

LOT 12 X 9000 TINY PLASTIC DECORATIVE BEADS

LASER PRINTER PRINT HEAD

PROMOTIONAL BLOC NOTE WITH LOGO - CTN OF 80 PCS
LOT OF 3 SETS BRAKE PADS

LOT OF 8 ENTRETOISE POUR ROULETTE MEUBLE

234 GASKET

235
236

METAL PART(TUBE EXPANDER)
FOG LIGHT

237 TAIL LAMP FOR MOTOR CAR

238

239
240
241

BLACK LACE

LOT OF : 50 EARPHONES,30 MIC CABLES,21 CHARGERS, 9 USB CABLES,4 AV CABLES,1
REMOTE CONTROL

DASH BOARD PART

LOT OF 50 PCS BALTI HANDLES

1LOT MOTOR PARTS : 1 PCINLET, 1 PC CLAMP-ROD HOOD, 1 PC BRUSH, 2 PCS DUST

242 COVER, 1 PC HINGE FOR DOOR

243
244
245
246
247
248
249

LOT OF TOOLS FOR CARPET HAND KNITTING : (2 SHUTTLES CIGAM &2 PICKER STICK CIGAM)
LOT OF 85 PCS POLO SHIRTS WITH LOGO TATA

LOT OF 90 PCS PUBLICITY T/SHIRTS

MOTEUR CCDC-GS (HPI)

USED CAMERA LUMIX W/O ACCS

USED HEADPHONE BOSE

USED DIGITAL CAMERA OLYMPUS W/O ACCS

250 WHITE BUILDERS HELMET

251
252

BATTERY CHARGER
LE COEUR REGULIER - OLIVIER ADAM

253 SET OF 2 BOOKS ON MANAGERIAL BEHAVIOUR / BTEC HIGHER NATIONAL IN BUSINESS

254

LOT OF 5 BOOKS

255 TRIENNALE DE CHAMALIERES

256
257
258

1 LOT OF 6 ASSORTED 50 CL ALCOHOLIC DRINKS (1 JACK DANIELS, 1 BRAASTAD COGNAC, 1
FAMOUS GROUSE, 3 AMARULLA LIQUOR)

1 J WALKER RED LABEL 70 CL AND 1 LOT OF 5 J.WALKER RED LABEL 100 CL

1 LOT OF 2 GRANTS 100 CL + 2 BALLANTINES 100 CL

1 LOT OF 10 SMIRNOFF VODKA 100 CL + 1 SMIRNOFF VODKA 50 CL + 1 SMIRNOFF VODKA 35

259 CL +1 ABSOLUT VODKA 20 CL

260

1LOT OF 4 ASSORTED AMARULLA LIQUOR 100 CL
1 LOT OF 2 X 70 CL ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS (1 HIGHLAND FALL + 1 KING KANE RUM) + 2 100

261 CL KING KANE RUM

262

263
264

1 LOT OF 3 ASSORTED BACARDI RUM 100 CL

1 LOT OF 7 ASSORTED SEVEN SEAS RUM (1 X37.5CL+1X 50CL+3 X 70CL)+ 1X 100 CL DE
LUXE RUM

1 LOT OF GREEN ISLAND RUM (1 X 20 CL+ 10X 35CL+1 X 70 CL)

91
453
453
453
453
453
453
136

91

2,039
204
2,039
101
611
680
203
169

1,223
1,017
1,869
2,039
663
950
1,326
271
63
203
30
84
169
204
271
238

1,970
271
68

638

680
1,901
1,069

611

453

680

194

35

475

24

95
12
15

1,540
4,580
3,165

8,612
440

1,144
888

997
1,221

300
900
850
1,160
1,615
1,300
2,177
1,300
300
2,510
300
2,500
200
1,000
1,000
300
200

1,300
1,490
1,900
2,100
700
1,688
1,785
300
1,200
509
NO BID RECEIVED
90
NO BID RECEIVED
801
350
310

2,005
426
NO BID RECEIVED

NO BID RECEIVED

890
2,089
2,350
2,600

600
1,005

550

100
1,100

55

100
110
30

5,000
6,200
5,100

8,700
1,290

1,510
1,510

1,550
1,355



1 LOT OF 7 ASSORTED RUM ( 1 X 35 CL BLACK HORSE + 3 X 35 CL RUM + 1 X 35 CL EAU DE
265 VIE +1 X 35 CL RHUM LIGHT + 1 X 375 ML TROPICAL RHUM)
266 1 LOT OF 16 GOODWILL RUM 70 CL
267 1LOT OF 3 X 70 CL GOODWILL LIGHT RUM + 2 POWERS NO. 1 RUM
268 LOT OF 5 ASSORTED CHAMAREL LIQUOR 50 CL
269 1 LOT OF 24 ASSORTED WINE 75 CL
270 1 LOT OF 3 OXENHAM OLD PORT WINE 70 CL + 6 ASSORTED CAPINELLA WINE
271 1 LOT OF 4 ASSORTED 75 CL WINE (2 DECRAMON + 2 CHAPTALIN)
272 1 LOT OF 18 ASSORTED CHAMPAGNE (16 X 75 CL+1 X 50 CL+1 X 37.5 CL)
273 1 LOT OF 6 ASSORTED ALCOHOLIC DRINKS
274 1 LOT OF 14 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE
275 1LOT OF 15 GOODWILL RUM 35 CL

276 RING 2.84 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.28 CT YELLOW GOLD
277 RING 3.23 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.20 CT YELLOW GOLD

278 RING 3.17 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.24 CT YELLOW GOLD
279 GOLD RING 2.69 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.27CT

280 GOLD RING 4.86 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.27CT

281 RING 1.96 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.13CT

282 GOLD RING 4.86 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.10 CT

283 RING 2.89 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND YELLOW GOLD AND SAPPHIRE
284 RING 1.65 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.10 CT YELLOW GOLD
285 GOLD RING 4.86 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.23 CT

286 GOLD RING 3.12 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

287 RING 3.37 G 18K GOLD

288 RING OF YELLOW METAL WITH 7 WHITE STONES 3.7G 18K GOLD

289 BLUE SAPPHIRE WITH DIAMOND GOLD RING 5.15G 18K

290 GOLD FINGER RING 2.16G 18K GOLD

291 RING 14k GOLD 7.15G

292 RING 3.27G 18K GOLD

293 RING 18K WHITE GOLD 1.69 G TAHITIAN PEARL 8.0-9.0MMM DIA 10RND/0.08CT
294 RING 1.60 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.34 CT

295 GOLD RING 2.55 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

296 RING 2.47 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.5 CT AND RUBY
297 RING 18K WHITE GOLD 3.91 G TAHITIAN PEARL 8.0-9.0MM DIA 2RND/0.04CT
298 RING 4.88 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

299 GOLD RING 1.75 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

300 RING 2.09 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.38 CT

301 RING 2.04 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

302 RING 1.87 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.24 CT

303 RING 2.56 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.15 CT

304 RING 2.55 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.19 CT

305 RING 18K WHITE GOLD 1.72 G WHITE DIAMOND 1RND/0.10CT

306 RING 1.25 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.27 CT

307 RING 1.91G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.20 CT

308 RING 2.50 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.22 CT

309 RING 2.48 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.23 CT

310 GOLD RING 4.90 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND AND SAPPHIRES
311 GOLD RING 2.49 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

312 GOLD RING 2.33 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.38CT

313 RING 2.04 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.25 CT

314 GOLD RING 2.15 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

315 RING 18K WHITE GOLD 1. 48 G WHITE PEARL 7.0-7.5MM DIA 8RND/0.04CT

316 RING 18K 3T GOLD 1.99 G WHITE DIAMOND 29RND/0.15CT

317 GOLD RING 2.46 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

318 GOLD RING 1.95 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND

319 RING 2.19 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.11 CT YELLOW GOLD
320 RING 18K GOLD 2.75 G WHITE GOLD TAHITIAN PEARL 8.0-8.5MM

321 BRACELET 18K WHITE GOLD DIA 0.25CT

322 GOLD CHAIN (18K GOLD) 10.96G

323 GOLD PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.03 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.047CT
324 PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.14 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.28CT

325 GOLD PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.63 G WHITE DIAMOND AND RUBY
326 PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.13 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.15CT

327 PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.81 G WHITE DIAMOND

328 PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.16 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.24CT

627
2,867
1,075

506
3,549

117

31
2,199

296

462

222

6,527
6,781

7,568
8,599
9,708
3,967
4,833

8,732
3,272
3,357
8,580
4,104
4,644
23,053
2,600
6,615
3,878
3,213
7,288
8,216
8,227
9,530
9,088
6,395
12,168
5,135
5,146
5,976
6,286
3,678
2,254
6,052
6,761
7,810
12,331
7,071
4,841
5,671
3,338
3,389
4,646
5,212
4,170
4,351
43,801
10,436
13,000
3,729
7,938

13,483
5,565
4,989
7,747

700
3,000
NO BID RECEIVED

1,600
5,100
1,015
600
18,000
4,115
1,850
851

7,501
NO BID RECEIVED

9,200
NO BID RECEIVED

11,200

4,201

5,090

12,559
5,000
5,500
NO BID RECEIVED
6,501
NO BID RECEIVED
27,693
3,000
7,000
4,000
4,200
7,500
9,500
12,501
15,710
15,315
NO BID RECEIVED
14,090
6,135
7,100
7,000
NO BID RECEIVED
5,090
6,090
7,000
16,277
NO BID RECEIVED
17,705
14,277
19,727
6,000
5,400
5,000
9,510
12,350
10,177
17,250
NO BID RECEIVED
20,436
14,700
4,600
17,938

16,911
14,200
10,215
10,000



329
330
331
332

PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.07 G WHITE DIAMOND
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.08 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.77 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.15CT
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.95 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.5CT

333 GOLD PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.32 G

334
335
336
337
338
339
340
341
342

343

344

345

346
347
348

349

350

351
352

353

354
355
356
357
358
359
360
361
362
363
364
365
366
367
368
369
370
371
372
373
374
375
376
377
378
379

380
381
382
383

PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.16 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.10CT
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.52 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.24CT
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.68 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.14CT
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.46 G WHITE DIAMOND

PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.89 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.14CT
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.940G WHITE DIAMOND

PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.34 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT
PENDANT-CHAIN 0.20CT 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.21 G WHITE DIAMOND
PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.33 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.51CT

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 1RND/0.06CT PENDANT 0.85G GOLD
PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 15RND/0.04CT PENDANT 1.51 G GOLD
PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 9RND/0.02CT PENDANT 137 G GOLD

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 11RND/0.13CT PENDANT 1.00 G GOLD

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND SRND PENDANT 0.85G GOLD
PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD 3.29 G WHITE DIAMOND 25RND/0.26CT

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 9RND/0.07CT PENDANT 0.91 G GOLD
PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 1RND/0.08CT PENDANT 0.42 G GOLD

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 25RND/0.07CT PENDANT 1.00 G GOLD

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD 1.79 G WHITE DIAMOND 11RND/0.24CT

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 3RND/0.06CT PENDANT 0.47 G GOLD

PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD WHITE DIAMOND 3RND/0.13CT PENDANT 0.42G GOLD

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.58 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.31 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.30 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.89 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.88 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.89 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.39CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.53 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.19 CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.66 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.51 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.17 CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2. 20 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.22CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.70 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.3 CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.30 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.76 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20 CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.62 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.24 G WHITE DIAMOND

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.41 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.62 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.32 G WHITE DIAMOND

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 0.82 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.08CT

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.93G WHITE DIAMOND 0.29CT WHITE GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.32 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.09CT

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.52 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.42 G AQUAMARINES

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.28 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.22 CT WHITE GOLD
EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.20 G TAHITIAN PEARL 10-10.5MM DIA

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.20GOLD TAHITIAN PEARL 8.0-9.0MM AND WHITE

DIAMOND 0.02CT

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.18 G WHITE DIAMOND

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.07 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.21 CT WHITE GOLD
EARING 18K GOLD 1.05G WHITE DIAMOND

5,172
6,256
4,811
41,086
5,473
5,411
9,383
6,012
6,392
5,086
5,146
6,700
6,758
9,798

2,096

2,407

1,970

3,885
1,988
6,211

2,168

1,578

2,276
7,302

1,477

2,221
5,118
4,794
3,548
7,422
8,482
8,172
5,058
5,107
3,855
5,864
6,550
4,798
5,978
5,166
3,132
4,914
7,573
3,601
2,327
6,076
4,162
5,046
2,030
4,758
5,995

5,097
5,841
5,708
7,913

12,857
10,000
5,100
51,277
6,200
5,600
10,100
8,999
8,892
8,947
5,500
8,070
12,877
13,811

3,500

7,410

5,345

10,600
3,699
10,200

3,500

3,809

3,111
11,258

3,809

6,415
5,200
5,000
4,000
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED
8,700
5,500
5,200
4,300
6,200
7,300
4,800
6,112
6,100
4,000
5,100
8,200
4,001
4,115
10,715
5,585
7,000
3,000
5,350
9,679

10,515
14,815
10,815
17,159



ONE LOT OF GOLD JEWELLERY:
1 CHAIN: 22.9 G 18K GOLD
1 CHAIN: 2.77 G 14K GOLD
1 PR EARING: 0.9 G 18K GOLD
1 EARING: 9K GOLD
1 BRACELET: 4.91G 18K GOLD
384 1 BROKEN RING: 3.55G 18K GOLD
LOT OF IMITATION JEWELLERY:
385 4 RINGS+ 1 BROKEN RING + 1 NECKLACE + 3 EARING + 3 PENDANTS + 1 CHAIN
386 PEARL NECKLACE (1 PCE), PEARL BRACELET (1 PCE) & PEARL EARING (1 PR)
387 CRISLU CHAIN
388 GOLD PLATED GOURMETS (NAME PLATE)
389 GOLD PLATED GOURMETS (NO NAME PLATE)
390 GOLD PLATED NECKLACES(27 + 1 IN SHED)
391 GOLD PLATED RINGS
392 NECKLACE WITH CRYSTAL CULTURED PEARL 7MM LENGTH 120CM
393 NECKLACE WITH CRYSTAL CULTURED PEARL 7MM LENGTH 120CM
394 NECKLACE CULTURED PEARL 7MM LENGTH 180CM
395 NECKLACE WITH CRYSTAL CULTURED PEARL 7MM LENGTH 120CM
396 NECKLACE NATURAL COLOR CULTURED PEARL 7MM LENGTH 180CM
397 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
398 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
399 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
400 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL
401 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL
402 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL
403 PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL
404 PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL
405 PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL
406 PENDANT OVAL MULTICOLOR R/P CZ
407 PENDANT OVAL MULTICOLOR R/P CZ
408 PENDANT OVAL MULTICOLOR R/P CZ
409 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL
410 BROOCH
411 PENDANT R/P ENAMEL CZ

412 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.64 G SILVER

413 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.60 G SILVER

414 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.55 G SILVER

415 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
416 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
417 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
418 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
419 PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL
420 PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL
421 PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL

422 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.51 G SILVER

423 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.60 G SILVER

424 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.61 G SILVER

425 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.58 G SILVER

426 PENDANT HEART MULTICOLOR R/P CZ
427 PENDANT R/P ENAMEL CZ

428 PENDANT ROUND MULTICOLOR R/P CZ
429 PENDANT ROUND MULTICOLOR R/P CZ

430 PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 7.0MM CHAIN 1.61 G SILVER
431 BROOCH R/P RCZ

432 BROOCH R/P RCZ

433 BROOCH R/P CRYSTAL

434 BROOCH R/P CRYSTAL

435 BROOCH R/P CRYSTAL

436 PENDANT WITH ENAMEL / CRYSTAL

437 PENDANT WITH ENAMEL / CRYSTAL

40,260

958
1,102
1,364

113

113

624

203
2,257
2,257
2,884
2,257
2,884

627

627

627

627

627

627

627

627

627

878

878

878

627

627

627

627

627

627
627
627
627
627
627
627
627

627

627

627

627
878
627
878
878

627
627
627
376
376
376
627
627

76,011

1,005
1,700
1,525

141

200

650

300
3,850
4,500
9,090
3,100
3,400
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,200
1,200
1,000
1,000
1,200
1,200
1,000
1,000

1,000

1,000

1,200
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000

1,200

1,200

1,350

1,000
1,000
1,000
1,000
1,100

1,200
NO BID RECEIVED
700
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED



438
439
440
441
442
443
444
445
446
447
448
449
450
451
452
453
454
455
456
457
458
459
460
461
462
463
464
465
466
467
468
469
470
471
472

NECKLACE R/P CZ

PENDANT SILVER 3.72 G WITH RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM
PENDANT CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM

PENDANT CUBIC ZIRCONIA

NECKLACE 10.41G SILVER R/P COLOUR CZ

EARRING CUBIC ZIRCONIAS

PENDANT R/P CZ

EARING C UBIC ZIRCONIA

NECKLACE SILVER R/P CZ CHAIN 1.63 G SILVER

NECKLACE 10.69 G SILVER R/P CRYSTAL

NECKLACE COLOUR CZ

NECKLACE 4.87 G SILVER R/P CRYSTAL

EARING SILVER R/P CUBIC ZIRCONIA

EARING CUBIC ZIRCONIA

NECKLACE 10.69 G SILVER R/P COLOUR CZ ONLY PENDANT 2.43 G SILVER
NECKLACE COLOUR CZ

NECKLACE 4.01 G SILVER R/P CRYSTAL

EARING SILVER R/P CULTURED PEARL,CUBIC ZIRCONIA

NECKLACE 12.66 G SILVER R/P CULTURED PEARL

EARING CLEAR CUBIC ZIRCONIA

NECKLACE SILVER R/P CRYSTAL CHAIN 1.73 G SILVER

NECKLACE SILVER R/P CZ CHAIN 1.45 G SILVER

PENDANT SILVER 4.82 G WITH RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM
EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES
EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES
EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES
EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES
EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES
NECKLACE Cz

NECKLACE 4.92 GSILVER R/P CRYSTAL

EARING CULTURED PEARL

EARING SILVER WITH RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM
NECKLACE CZ

NECKLACE SILVER R/P CRYSTAL CHAIN 1.59 G SILVER

NECKLACE CULTURED PEARL

PENDANT SILVER WITH RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM CHAIN 1.58 G

473 SILVER

474
475
476

PENDANT SILVER 3.88 G R/P CULTURED PEARL 8.5-9.0MM
PENDANT R/P CZ
PENDANT SILVER 4.71 G RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM

PENDANT SILVER WITH RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM CHAIN 1.58 G

477 SILVER

478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485

PENDANT WITH ENAMEL / CRYSTAL

NECKLACE COLOUR CZ

EARING R/P CUBIC ZIRCONIA

EARING CUBIC ZIRCONIA

NECKLACE SILVER R/P CRYSTAL CHAIN 1.58 G SILVER
NECKLACE SILVER R/P CZ CHAIN 1.56 G SILVER
NECKLACE CZ

PENDANT CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM

486 ONE CHAIN & ONE PENDANT

533
627
627
1,003
1,003
172
878
43
533
1,097
1,003
1,097
86
172
1,003
1,003
1,097
228
1,003
172
1,097
533
627
86
257
86
172
215
533
1,097
215
229
533
1,097
1,003

627
627
878
627

627
627
1,003
172
86
1,097
533
533
627
4,170

733
1,315
901
1,300
1,425
220
920
61
1,515
1,345
1,300
NO BID RECEIVED
101
181
1,250
NO BID RECEIVED
1,500
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED
1,205
NO BID RECEIVED
1,700
1,215
201
261
NO BID RECEIVED
390
NO BID RECEIVED
550
1,715
265
329
545
1,200
1,100

800

926
NO BID RECEIVED
NO BID RECEIVED

700
NO BID RECEIVED
1,015
205
101
NO BID RECEIVED
700
550
1,510
5,107



