Description Price (Rs.) | Reserve Price
(Rs.)
USED SUBARU IMPREZA : AS IS WHERE IS UNIT 378184
NO BID RECEIVED
USED NISSAN SUNNY : AS IS WHERE Is UNIT 158130
NO BID RECEIVED
USED KIA TRUCK : AS IS WHERE IS UNIT 59397
HIGHEST BID 125000 1st Bidder
USED MOTORCYCLE HONDA : AS IS WHERE Is UNIT 28892
HIGHEST BID 68000 1st Bidder
1 LOT USED MOTOR VEHICLE SPARE PARTS UNIT 132073
NO BID RECEIVED
ONE NEW ELECTRIC PACKING MACHINE - XINS/ UNIT 28290
HIGHEST BID 41000 1st Bidder
1 LOT 2050 CTNS X 140 PCS GLASS BOTTLES 90 ML ( 20% LOT 10000
BROKEN)
HIGHEST BID 15000 1st Bidder
1 LOT HANDICRAFT / DECO ITEMS : LOT 64151
HIGHEST BID 175000 1st Bidder
LOT OF TESTER / UNSEALED CLARINS COSMETICS LOT 26789
HIGHEST BID 30000 1st Bidder
ELECTRIC MOTOR MOVIMOT-INCOMPLETE UNIT 10296
NO BID RECEIVED
COVIDIEN PURITAN BENNETT VENTILLATOR UNIT 147840
NO BID RECEIVED
1 LOT MEDICAL MATERIAL UNIT 17968
NO BID RECEIVED
BLEACHING SYSTEM FOR TEETH WHITENING UNITS 12489
HIGHEST BID 13000 1st Bidder
USED NOODLE MAKER UNIT 1888
HIGHEST BID 6000 1st Bidder
USED STEAMER UNIT 1403
HIGHEST BID 2225 1st Bidder
WOODEN CHEST PC 2758
HIGHEST BID 7500 1st Bidder
INCOMPLETE COMPRESSOR FOR BEER DISPENSER UNIT 1716
HIGHEST BID 3000 1st Bidder
USED MEAT GRINDER UNIT 1716
HIGHEST BID 3000 1st Bidder
SOFA - PARTLY DAMAGED UNIT 788
HIGHEST BID 1658 1st Bidder
MDF CUPBOARD - PARTLY DAMAGED UNIT 1051
HIGHEST BID 2001 1st Bidder




USED REFRIGERATED AIR DRYER - PARTLY DAMAGED UNIT 1716
HIGHEST BID 2100 1st Bidder
USED MOUNTED CUTTING DISC W/O MOTOR UNIT 1123
HIGHEST BID 1231 1st Bidder
USED COOLING MACHINE OLSIZEN - PARTLY DAMAGED UNIT 1716
HIGHEST BID 1900 1st Bidder
USED REFR1GERATOR DAEWOO UNIT 2340
HIGHEST BID 3519 1st Bidder
1 LOT OF 20 PCS DAMAGED/DENTED METAL DOOR FRAMES UNIT 4343
NO BID RECEIVED

1 LOT SCRAP METAL LoT Rs 5/ KG
HIGHEST BID 496 1st Bidder
PLASTIC ROLL ROLL 515
HIGHEST BID 718 1st Bidder
1 LOT : EARTHING ELECTRODE Lor 1716
HIGHEST BID 2200 1st Bidder
BOPP FILM ROLL ROLL 429
HIGHEST BID 700 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 M/V BUMPER Lor 2574
HIGHEST BID 2841 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 M/V BUMPER Lor 2574
HIGHEST BID 2951 1st Bidder
BUMPER SUPPORT PC 858
HIGHEST BID 901 1st Bidder
BELLS 100 CL BTL 980.628
HIGHEST BID 1410 1st Bidder
J/W RED LABEL 100 CL BTL 998.085
HIGHEST BID 1282 1st Bidder
J/W RED LABEL PLASTIC BOTTLE 100 CL BTL 998.085
HIGHEST BID 1105 1st Bidder
J/W RED LABEL 200 CL BTL 1996.17
HIGHEST BID 2700 1st Bidder
J/W RED LABEL 70 CL BTL 698.6595
HIGHEST BID 807 1st Bidder
J/W RED LABEL 50 CL BTL 499.0425
HIGHEST BID 551 1st Bidder
J/W BLACK LABEL 100 CL BTL 1207.569
HIGHEST BID 1801 1st Bidder
J/W BLACK LABEL 50 CL BTL 603.7845
HIGHEST BID 760 1st Bidder
J/W DOUBLE BLACK 100 CL BTL 1259.94
HIGHEST BID 2600 1st Bidder
J/W EXPLORERS COLLECTION SPICE ROAD 100 CL BTL 1905.849
HIGHEST BID 2900 1st Bidder




J/W ROYAL ROUTE 100 CL BTL 2481.93
J/W GOLDEN ROUTE 100 CL BTL 1958.22
HIGHEST BID 2695 1st Bidder
J/W BLUE LABEL 100CL BTL 3776
HIGHEST BID 6700 1st Bidder
J/W BLUE LABEL 20CL BTL 755
HIGHEST BID 2200 1st Bidder
LABEL 5 WHISKY 70 CL BTL 686.4396
HIGHEST BID 801 1st Bidder
GRANTS 70 CL BTL 646.2885
HIGHEST BID 735 1st Bidder
GRANTS 100 CL BTL 919.5285
HIGHEST BID 1150 1st Bidder
GRANTS 150 CL BTL 1374.9285
HIGHEST BID 1801 1st Bidder
BALLANTINES WHISKY 100 CL BTL 980.628
HIGHEST BID 1400 1st Bidder
BUSHMILLS WHISKY 100 CL BTL 998.085
HIGHEST BID 1400 1st Bidder
BLACK NIGHT WHISKY 75 CL BTL 692.01825
HIGHEST BID 850 1st Bidder
TEACHERS 100 CL BTL 980.628
HIGHEST BID 1131 1st Bidder
TEACHERS 75 CL BTL 735.66075
HIGHEST BID 845 1st Bidder
GLEN GRANT 100 CL BTL 1019.0334
HIGHEST BID 1900 1st Bidder
GLENMORANGIE WHISKY 70 CL BTL 908.1435
HIGHEST BID 1604 1st Bidder
BLACK GROUSE WHISKY 100 CL BTL 989.3565
HIGHEST BID 1209 1st Bidder
WILLIAM LAWSON 70 CL BTL 689.931
HIGHEST BID 1050 1st Bidder
WILLIAM LAWSON 100 CL BTL 985
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
JIM BEAM 100 CL BTL 931.7484
HIGHEST BID 1225 1st Bidder
JAMESON 100 CL BTL 1022.5248
HIGHEST BID 1548 1st Bidder
JAMESON 50 CL BTL 5711.2624
HIGHEST BID 700 1st Bidder
JAMESON 20 CL BTL 204.8541
HIGHEST BID 300 1st Bidder
JAMESON GOLD RESERVE 70 CL BTL 812.13




HIGHEST BID 1600 1st Bidder
JAMESON SIGNATURE 50 CL BTL 516.4995
HIGHEST BID 718 1st Bidder
J&B70CL BTL 698.6595
HIGHEST BID 810 1st Bidder
J& B 100 CL BTL 998.085
HIGHEST BID 1380 1st Bidder
wWB 70 CL BTL 659
HIGHEST BID 850 1st Bidder
GENTLEMAN JACK 100 CL BTL 1172.655
HIGHEST BID 2001 1st Bidder
JACK DANIEL 100 CL BTL 1067.913
HIGHEST BID 11000 1st Bidder
JACK DANIEL 70 CL BTL 751.0305
HIGHEST BID 1809 1st Bidder
JACK DANIEL 50 CL BTL 516.4995
HIGHEST BID 702 1st Bidder
JACK DANIEL 20 CL - LOT OF 2 BTLS LorTr 427
HIGHEST BID 605 1st Bidder
JACK DANIEL 5 CL - LOT OF 5 BTLS LorTr 267
HIGHEST BID 600 1st Bidder
MAC BRIDES WHISKY 70 CL BTL 707.388
HIGHEST BID 900 1st Bidder
CHIVAS REGAL 100 CL BTL 1190.112
HIGHEST BID 1601 1st Bidder
CHIVAS REGAL 50 CL BTL 595.056
HIGHEST BID 768 1st Bidder
CHIVAS REGAL 70 CL BTL 829.587
HIGHEST BID 1297 1st Bidder
IMPERIAL BLUE WHISKY 75 CL BTL 752.928
HIGHEST BID 1200 1st Bidder
ROYAL STAG WHISKY 75 CL BTL 752.928
HIGHEST BID 895 1st Bidder
NIKKA WHISKY 50 CL BTL 507.771
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
LAGAVULIN 70 CL BTL 1431.8535
HIGHEST BID 2048 1st Bidder
HUNTING LODGE WHISKY 100 CL BTL 618
HIGHEST BID 925 1st Bidder
HEAVEN HILL BOURBON WHISKY 100 CL BTL 981
HIGHEST BID 1450 1st Bidder
TULLAMORE WHISKY 100 CL BTL 1102.827
HIGHEST BID 1280 1st Bidder
GLENLIVET 100 CL BTL 1408.3245
HIGHEST BID 1880 1st Bidder




GLENFIDDICH 100 CL BTL 1277.397
HIGHEST BID 1648 1st Bidder
GLENFIDDICH 100 CL 18 YRS BTL 1643.994
HIGHEST BID 2601 1st Bidder
GLENFIDDICH 70 CL BTL 894
HIGHEST BID 1200 1st Bidder
JURA WHISKY 100 CL BTL 1141.2324
HIGHEST BID 2058 1st Bidder
HEDGES & BUTLERS WHISKY 100 CL BTL 618
HIGHEST BID 801 1st Bidder
DALMORE WHISKY 100 CL BTL 1664.9424
HIGHEST BID 1910 1st Bidder
ROYAL SALUTE 100 CL BTL 2385.9165
HIGHEST BID 4000 1st Bidder
THREE SHIPS WHISKY 75 CL BTL 744.1995
HIGHEST BID 1158 1st Bidder
WRIGHT & GREIGH WHISKY 150 CL BTL 827.31
HIGHEST BID 1111 1st Bidder
CLAN CAMPBELL WHISKY 100 CL BTL 893.343
HIGHEST BID 1111 1st Bidder
FAMOUS GROUSE 100 CL BTL 1015.542
HIGHEST BID 1111 1st Bidder
FAMOUS GROUSE 50 CL BTL 508
HIGHEST BID 551 1st Bidder
LABEL 5 WHISKY 100 CL BTL 980.628
HIGHEST BID 1175 1st Bidder
MAC ANDREWS WHISKY 100 CL BTL 980.628
HIGHEST BID 1129 1st Bidder
GLENROTHERS WHISKY 100 CL BTL 989.3565
HIGHEST BID 1900 1st Bidder
BALVENIE WHISKY 100 CL + 5 CL SET 1434.0546
HIGHEST BID 1550 1st Bidder
TALISKER WHISKY 100 CL BTL 1303.5825
HIGHEST BID 1610 1st Bidder
DEWARS WHISKY 100 CL BTL 998.085
HIGHEST BID 1350 1st Bidder
GOLD MASTERS WHISKY 70 CL BTL 724.845
HIGHEST BID 885 1st Bidder
ABERLOUR 100 CL BTL 1155.198
HIGHEST BID 1479 1st Bidder
PARKERS WHISKY 100 CL BTL 1050.456
HIGHEST BID 1251 1st Bidder
BLACK CROW WHISKY 70 CL BTL 707.388
HIGHEST BID 928 1st Bidder




HIGHLAND RESERVE WHISKY 70 CL BTL 707.388
HIGHEST BID 878 1st Bidder
WHITE & MACKAY 100 CL BTL 1019
HIGHEST BID 1350 1st Bidder
WHITE & MACKAY 35 CL BTL 356
HIGHEST BID 390 1st Bidder
CROWN ROYAL 375 ML BTL 370
HIGHEST BID 550 1st Bidder
ASCOTT BRANDY 70 CL BTL 655.017
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
KWV BRANDY 75 CL BTL 709.2855
NO BID RECEIVED

THREE BARRELS BRANDY 100 CL BTL 902.0715
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
MARTELL VSOP COGNAC 100 CL BTL 1624
HIGHEST BID 1625 1st Bidder
HENNESSY VSOP COGNAC 100 CL BTL 1277.397
HIGHEST BID 1525 1st Bidder
COURVOISIER COGNAC 100 CL BTL 1303.5825
HIGHEST BID 1425 1st Bidder
BRAASTAD COGNAC 50 CcL BTL 650
HIGHEST BID 701 1st Bidder
BRAASTAD COGNAC 100 CL BTL 1300
HIGHEST BID 1501 1st Bidder
REMY MARTIN CHAMPAGNE COGNAC 100 CL BTL 1841.2075
HIGHEST BID 1600 BELOW RP
DISARONO LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 367
HIGHEST BID 600 1st Bidder
DRAMBUIE LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 407
HIGHEST BID 548 1st Bidder
FINLANDIA MANGO VODKA 100 CL BTL 893.343
HIGHEST BID 350 BELOW RP
FINLANDIA VODKA 50 CL BTL 447
HIGHEST BID 200 BELOW RP
ABSOLUT VODKA 70 CL BTL 692
HIGHEST BID 730 1st Bidder
ABSOLUT RASPBERRY VODKA 100 CL BTL 989.3565
HIGHEST BID 1082 1st Bidder
ABSOLUT CITRON VODKA 100 CL BTL 989.3565
HIGHEST BID 200 BELOW RP
ABSOLUT VODKA 100 CL BTL 989.3565
HIGHEST BID 990 1st Bidder
SMIRNOFF VODKA 35 CL BTL 318.78
HIGHEST BID 200 BELOW RP




SMIRNOFF VODKA 100 CL BTL 902.0715
HIGHEST BID 1050 1st Bidder
SMIRNOFF VODKA 50 CL BTL 451.9086
HIGHEST BID 750 1st Bidder
MOSKOVSKAYA VODKA 100 CL BTL 905.5629
HIGHEST BID 1250 1st Bidder
CIROC VODKA 100 CL BTL 905.5629
HIGHEST BID 1999 1st Bidder
STOLICHINAYA VODKA BTL 932
HIGHEST BID 200 BELOW RP
WILKINSON VODKA 100 CL BTL 884.6145
HIGHEST BID 200 BELOW RP
ZUBROWKA VODKA 100 CL BTL 885
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
XUXU VODKA 100 CL BTL 884.6145
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
BOMBAY SAPHIRE GIN 100 CL BTL 552.552
HIGHEST BID 829 1st Bidder
TANQUERAY GIN 100 CL BTL 538.5864
HIGHEST BID 875 1st Bidder
GORDON GIN 100 CL BTL 412
HIGHEST BID 718 1st Bidder
GORDON GIN 50 CL BTL 206
HIGHEST BID 281 1st Bidder
HENDRICKS GIN 100 CL BTL 648.5655
HIGHEST BID 976 1st Bidder
GILBEYS GIN 35 CL BTL 144.5136
HIGHEST BID 165 1st Bidder
BOKMA GIN 100 CL BTL 535.095
HIGHEST BID 750 1st Bidder
PASTIS 51 100 CL BTL 381.8782
HIGHEST BID 850 1st Bidder
COINTREAU LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 596
HIGHEST BID 725 1st Bidder
OLMECA TEQUILLA 100 CL BTL 1062
HIGHEST BID 1100 1st Bidder
DANZKA VODKA 100 CL BTL 1019
HIGHEST BID 1250 1st Bidder
PEPE LOPEZ TEQUILLA 100 cL BTL 998.085
HIGHEST BID 1200 1st Bidder
TEQUILLA SAUZA 100 CcL BTL 998.085
HIGHEST BID 1100 1st Bidder
PATRON TEQUILLA 70 CL BTL 691.0695
HIGHEST BID 800 1st Bidder




TEQUILLA MILAGRO 75 CL BTL 831.4845
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
TIA MARIA LIQUOR 100CL BTL 1032.999
HIGHEST BID 1150 1st Bidder
TOLON-TOLON LIQUEUR 70 CL BTL 296.6425
HIGHEST BID 550 1st Bidder
PONCHOS LIQUEUR 75 CL BTL 278.553
HIGHEST BID 1350 1st Bidder
BAILEY'S LIQUOR 70 CL BTL 287.914
HIGHEST BID 355 1st Bidder
BAILEY'S LIQUOR 75 CL BTL 313.467
HIGHEST BID 410 1st Bidder
BAILEY'S LIQUOR 50 CL BTL 194.4305
HIGHEST BID 254 1st Bidder
BAILEY'S LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 388.861
HIGHEST BID 558 1st Bidder
SHERIDANS COFFEE LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 441.232
HIGHEST BID 801 1st Bidder
MAURICIA TAMARIN LIQUOR 75 CL BTL 242
HIGHEST BID 270 1st Bidder
WILD AFRICA 100 CL BTL 336.49
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
AMARULA LIQUOR 37.5 CL BTL 120.0738
HIGHEST BID 168 1st Bidder
AMARULA LIQUOR 50 cL BTL 159.5165
HIGHEST BID 250 1st Bidder
AMARULA LIQUOR 75 CL BTL 239.27475
HIGHEST BID 388 1st Bidder
AMARULA GOLD LIQUOR 75 CL BTL 239.27475
HIGHEST BID 390 1st Bidder
AMARULA LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 3719.033
HIGHEST BID 558 1st Bidder
AMARULA GOLD LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 336.49
HIGHEST BID 558 1st Bidder
PARADISE ROYAL CREAM 70 CL BTL 298
HIGHEST BID 358 1st Bidder
L/IQUOR GET 27 100 CL BTL 301.576
HIGHEST BID 428 1st Bidder
SUZE 100 CL BTL 336
HIGHEST BID 436 1st Bidder
SOUTHERN COMFORT 20 CL BTL 77.7722
HIGHEST BID 112 1st Bidder
COCO D'AMOUR 70 CL BTL 270.457
HIGHEST BID 400 1st Bidder




MARTINI DRY 100 CL BTL 395.8185
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
MARTINI BIANCO 100 CL BTL 395.8185
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
MARTINI ROSSO 100 CL BTL 395.8185
HIGHEST BID 600 1st Bidder
MARTINI ROSATO 100 CL BTL 395.8185
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
CAMPARI LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 442.9524
HIGHEST BID 510 1st Bidder
BRIGADIER SAMBUCA 70 CL BTL 191
HIGHEST BID 255 1st Bidder
RICARD 100 CL BTL 371.404
HIGHEST BID 511 1st Bidder
JAGERMEITER LIQUOR 100 CL BTL 406.318
HIGHEST BID 812 1st Bidder
CHARTREUSE LIQUOR 50 CL BTL 159.5165
HIGHEST BID 172 1st Bidder
MARIE BRIZARD 75 CL BTL 255.8589
HIGHEST BID 321 1st Bidder
EXOTIQUE SPIRIT 75 CL BTL 182.5395
HIGHEST BID 249 1st Bidder
RUM DES ILES 70 CL BTL 167
HIGHEST BID 167 1st Bidder
HIGH SEAS COMMANDER RUM 70 CL BTL 167
HIGHEST BID 177 1st Bidder
BLUE MAURITIUS GOLD RUM 70 CL BTL 219.1992
HIGHEST BID 438 1st Bidder
CHARETTE RUM 70 CL BTL 227.9277
HIGHEST BID 258 1st Bidder
CHARETTE RUM 100 CL BTL 325.611
HIGHEST BID 396 1st Bidder
CHARETTE RUM 150 CL BTL 489
HIGHEST BID 606 1st Bidder
CHARETTE RUM 450 CL BTL 1465.2495
HIGHEST BID 1900 1st Bidder
RHUMEUR 50CL BTL 179.883
HIGHEST BID 195 1st Bidder
CHAMAREL LIQUOR ASSORTED FLAVOURS 50 CL BTL 187.473
HIGHEST BID 275 1st Bidder
CHAMAREL LIQUOR ASSORTED FLAVOURS 70 CL BTL 257.9082
HIGHEST BID 290 1st Bidder
CHAMAREL RHUM AGRICOLE 100CL BTL 374.946
HIGHEST BID 450 1st Bidder




TROPICAL RUM 375 ML BTL 106
NO BID RECEIVED

POWER'S NO.1 70 CL BTL 197
NO BID RECEIVED

BACARDI RUM 100 CL BTL 465.267
HIGHEST BID 800 1st Bidder
DZAMA RUM 100 CL BTL 412
HIGHEST BID 450 1st Bidder
DZAMA RUM 70 CL BTL 288
NO BID RECEIVED

GOODWILL RUM 35 CL BTL 106.1841
HIGHEST BID 72 BELOW RP
GOODWILL RUM LIGHT 35 CL BTL 95.0015
HIGHEST BID 71 BELOW RP
GOODWILL RUM 70 CL BTL 197.087
HIGHEST BID 198 1st Bidder
GOODWILL RUM LIGHT 70 CL BTL 167.992
HIGHEST BID 200 1st Bidder
GOODWILL RUM LIGHT 100 CL BTL 242.15895
HIGHEST BID 248 1st Bidder
GREEN ISLAND 100 CL BTL 314.226
NO BID RECEIVED

GREEN ISLAND 70 CL BTL 212.267
HIGHEST BID 242 1st Bidder
GREEN ISLAND 35 CL BTL 113.7235
HIGHEST BID 135 1st Bidder
GREEN ISLAND 20 CL BTL 62.8452
HIGHEST BID 135 1st Bidder
GREEN ISLAND SPICE GOLD 70 CL BTL 212.267
HIGHEST BID 275 1st Bidder
GREEN ISLAND OAK AGED 70 CL BTL 235.037
HIGHEST BID 243 1st Bidder
ISAUTIER ANISETTE 100 CL BTL 350
HIGHEST BID 419 1st Bidder
ISAUTIER RUM EXOTIQUE 70 CL BTL 245.2835
HIGHEST BID 299 1st Bidder
ISAUTIER GINGEMBRE/CITRON 70 CL BTL 245.2835
HIGHEST BID 299 1st Bidder
ISAUTIER ASS PUNCH 70 CL BTL 163.5645
HIGHEST BID 225 1st Bidder
TROPIC PUNCH coco 70 cL BTL 153.318
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
RUM CHAMAREL VSOP 70 CL BTL 254.1132
HIGHEST BID 300 1st Bidder




LABOURDONNAIS RUM 72 CL BTL 258
HIGHEST BID 309 1st Bidder
TAKAMAKA RUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 70 CL BTL 245.3847
HIGHEST BID 301 1st Bidder
CAPTAIN MORGAN RUM 100 CL + 20 CL LOoT 508
HIGHEST BID 660 1st Bidder
TI RUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 50 CL BTL 141.933
NO BID RECEIVED

ST AUBIN RUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 50 CL BTL 187.473
HIGHEST BID 215 1st Bidder
ST AUBIN RUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 75CL BTL 269.8245
HIGHEST BID 312 1st Bidder
ST AUBIN RUM 70 CL BTL 257.9082
HIGHEST BID 270 1st Bidder
BOUGAINVILLE RUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 50 CL BTL 187.473
HIGHEST BID 209 1st Bidder
SAVANNA RUM 70 CL BTL 228
HIGHEST BID 241 1st Bidder
NEW GROVE RUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 33 CL BTL 124.18505
HIGHEST BID 159 1st Bidder
NEW GROVE RUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 70CL BTL 257.807
HIGHEST BID 262 1st Bidder
PINK PIGEON RUM 70 CL BTL 257.807
HIGHEST BID 315 1st Bidder
VIEUX RUM DE MADAGASCAR 70 CL BTL 235.037
HIGHEST BID 829 1st Bidder
VIEUX RUM VANILLE 70 CL BTL 235.037
HIGHEST BID 629 1st Bidder
SEVEN SEAS 37.5 CL BTL 95.7605
HIGHEST BID 115 1st Bidder
SEVEN SEAS 100 CL BTL 254.07525
HIGHEST BID 279 1st Bidder
SEVEN SEAS 70 CL BTL 176.341
HIGHEST BID 192 1st Bidder
WHITE DIAMOND 35 CL BTL 95.7605
HIGHEST BID 115 1st Bidder
WHITE DIAMOND 100 CL BTL 254.07525
NO BID RECEIVED

L'’AVENTURE RUM 70 CL BTL 257.807
HIGHEST BID 270 1st Bidder
L'’AVENTURE RUM 37.5 CL BTL 128.9035
HIGHEST BID 151 1st Bidder
KENYA CANE RUM 75 CL BTL 228
HIGHEST BID 258 1st Bidder




BLACK HORSE RUM 70 CL BTL 197.087
NO BID RECEIVED

BOND 7 RUM 35 CL BTL 96
HIGHEST BID 130 1st Bidder
DE LUXE RUM 37.5 CL BTL 77.4939
HIGHEST BID 85 1st Bidder
DE LUXE RUM 70 CL BTL 176.341
NO BID RECEIVED

ZACAPA RUM 100 CL BTL 919.149
NO BID RECEIVED

BUNDABURG RUM 1125 ML BTL 937
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
MANGUSTAN RUM 70 CL BTL 228
HIGHEST BID 375 1st Bidder
OLD MILL RUM 70 CL BTL 212.267
HIGHEST BID 280 1st Bidder
BACARDI RUM 50 CL BTL 232
NO BID RECEIVED

RED HEART RUM 75 CL BTL 309.5455
HIGHEST BID 338 1st Bidder
RIVIERE DU MAT RUM 70 CL BTL 271.469
HIGHEST BID 365 1st Bidder
METAXA SPIRIT 100 CL BTL 369.6583
HIGHEST BID 525 1st Bidder
MALIBU 100 CL BTL 364.4212
HIGHEST BID 458 1st Bidder
MALIBU 75 CL BTL 273.3159
HIGHEST BID 358 1st Bidder
BUTLERS MARULA CREAM 75 CL BTL 365.838
HIGHEST BID 378 1st Bidder
SANTIAGO DE CUBA RUM 100 CL BTL 528.517
HIGHEST BID 549 1st Bidder
HENRI BARDOUIN PASTIS 70 CL BTL 357.742
HIGHEST BID 445 1st Bidder
BRIGHTON SPIRIT 150 CL BTL 522.192
HIGHEST BID 703 1st Bidder
ZUBROWKA VODKA 50 CL BTL 322
HIGHEST BID 401 1st Bidder
ABSOLUT VODKA 50 CL BTL 316
HIGHEST BID 375 1st Bidder
BEEFEATER GIN - LOT OF 5 BTLS X 50 ML Lor 140
HIGHEST BID 327 1st Bidder
MARTINNI BIANCO - LOT OF 5 BTLS X 50 ML Lor 99
HIGHEST BID 367 1st Bidder




POIRE WILLIAM EAU DE VIE 70 CL BTL 1409
NO BID RECEIVED
MARTINI ROSE SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 342.6885
HIGHEST BID 405 1st Bidder
BRUT DARGENT SPARKLING WINE 150 CL BTL 1100
HIGHEST BID 1301 1st Bidder
HENRIOT CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1323.73395
NO BID RECEIVED
MOET & CHANDON CHAMPAGNE 37.5 CL BTL 1011.4434
NO BID RECEIVED
AYALA CHAMPAGNE 37.5 CL BTL 650.0835
HIGHEST BID 202 BELOW RP
NICOLAS FEUILLATE CHAMPAGNE 37.5 CL BTL 658.812
HIGHEST BID 550 1st Bidder
NICOLAS FEUILLATE CHAMPAGNE 50 CL BTL 872.597
NO BID RECEIVED
DEUTZ BRUT ROSE CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1326.3525
NO BID RECEIVED
DEUTZ CLASSIC CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1326.3525
NO BID RECEIVED
VEUVE CLICQUOT CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 2124.1374
NO BID RECEIVED
G H MUMM CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1500.9225
NO BID RECEIVED
LANSON CHAMPAGNE 100 CL BTL 1849.936
NO BID RECEIVED
LANSON ROSE CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1518.3795
NO BID RECEIVED
KLIPFEL SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED
KWV SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 1158
NO BID RECEIVED
MOSCATO BOTTEGA SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED
PROSECCO COLLINA SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED
LOUIS PERDRIER SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED
POMMERY CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1326.3525
NO BID RECEIVED
LAURENT PERRIER CHAMPAGNE 37.5 CL BTL 1099.4115




NO BID RECEIVED

LAURENT PERRIER CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1500.9225
HIGHEST BID 1901 1st Bidder
LABORIE SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED

PALME D'OR BRUT CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1326.3525
HIGHEST BID 2599 1st Bidder
PONGRAZ SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED

SIMONSIG SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED

TAITTINGER CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1562.022
NO BID RECEIVED

VILLIERA TRADITION SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 865
NO BID RECEIVED

HEIDSICK CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1431.0945
NO BID RECEIVED

CUVE ROYAL AMBRE SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 94.40695
HIGHEST BID 108 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 BTLS - CUVE MARITIME SPARKLING WINE 75 CL LorTr 376
HIGHEST BID 600 1st Bidder
CAPINELLA BRUT SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 101.99695
HIGHEST BID 155 1st Bidder
CAPINELLA ROSE SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 101.99695
HIGHEST BID 201 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 BTLS - LA PLANTATION ROSE SPARKLING WINE 75 LoT 408
CL

HIGHEST BID 600 1st Bidder
LOT OF 12 BTLS - DE CRAMON SPARKLING WINE 75 CL LoT 1044
HIGHEST BID 1200 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 BTLS - MONTREVEL SPARKLING WINE 75 CL LoT 282
HIGHEST BID 308 1st Bidder
JP CHENET WINE 75 CL BTL 290.3175
HIGHEST BID 351 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 BTLS - CILAOS WINE 75 CL LoT 218
HIGHEST BID 316 1st Bidder
SAVIGNY DE BEAUNES WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
NO BID RECEIVED

PRINCE DE SIGOGNAL WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
NO BID RECEIVED

CULEMBORG WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 311 1st Bidder




BELLINGHAM WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
HOWARD PARK WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
NO BID RECEIVED

BOURGOGNE ALLIGOTE WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
NO BID RECEIVED

KANACO ROSE WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
NO BID RECEIVED

FRIZZANTE WINE 75 CL -LOCAL BTL 92
HIGHEST BID 125 1st Bidder
LES JOLIES FILLES WINE 75 CL BTL 264.132
NO BID RECEIVED

CROUCHEN RIESELING WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 342 1st Bidder
LANDSKROOM WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 311 1st Bidder
LEEUWIN STATE WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
LA MAISON BLEU WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 326 1st Bidder
CADET SOUTARD WINE 75 CL BTL 333.96
HIGHEST BID 629 1st Bidder
CHAPTALAIN WINE 75 CL BTL 72
HIGHEST BID 120 1st Bidder
MOUTON CADET SAUTERNES WINE 75 CL BTL 395.0595
HIGHEST BID 709 1st Bidder
CHATEAU DES LEOTINS WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 408 1st Bidder
KWV CABERNET WINE 75 CL BTL 368.874
HIGHEST BID 402 1st Bidder
VAL ORY WINE 75 CL BTL 84
HIGHEST BID 109 1st Bidder
BOPLAAS WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

ONE LOT OF 6 BTLS - LE MERIDIEN 75 CL Lor 516
HIGHEST BID 578 1st Bidder
LES COTEAUX CABERNET WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 327 1st Bidder
GARRIGOTTES WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
NO BID RECEIVED

RUPERT & ROTTSCHILD WINE 75 CL BTL 368.874
NO BID RECEIVED

LOUIS RODERER WINE 75 CL BTL 368.874




HIGHEST BID 400 1st Bidder
LOT OF 10 BTLS - DIVINE WINE 50 CL Lor 600
HIGHEST BID 800 1st Bidder
LA PIROGUE WINE 37.5 CL BTL 47.8676
HIGHEST BID 69 1st Bidder
FLEUR DU CAP WINE 75 CL BTL 264.132
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
KWV WINE 75 CL BTL 368.874
HIGHEST BID 376 1st Bidder
BUITENVERWACHTING WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 321 1st Bidder
BOSCHENDAL WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 355 1st Bidder
PEPPER JACK WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

GLEN CARLOU WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 301 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 BTLS - CORDON WINE 70 CL LorTr 234
HIGHEST BID 301 1st Bidder
ASSORTED NEDERBURG WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 334 1st Bidder
LAMBRUSCO WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
CAPINELLA WINE 75 CL BTL 94.116
HIGHEST BID 125 1st Bidder
LAVENIR WINE 75 CL BTL 91.08
HIGHEST BID 110 1st Bidder
COMPTE DE SENNVALE CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1465
NO BID RECEIVED

ROBERTSON WINERY 75 CL BTL 272.8605
HIGHEST BID 301 1st Bidder
LADY BIRD WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 400 1st Bidder
CHATEAU DE PIBARNON WINE 75 CL BTL 325.2315
HIGHEST BID 375 1st Bidder
CHINKARA WINE 37.5 CL BTL 123.3375
HIGHEST BID 150 1st Bidder
LOT OF 20 ASSORTED WINES LoTr 800
HIGHEST BID 1355 1st Bidder
SET OF 5 X 75 CL TEMPLARSKE WINE SET 1320.66
HIGHEST BID 1506 1st Bidder
VERGELEGEN WINE 75 CL BTL 351.417
NO BID RECEIVED

SEGRETO WINE 75 CL BTL 311




HIGHEST BID 360 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 BTLS - BLUE LAGOON WINE 75 CL Lor 192
HIGHEST BID 256 1st Bidder
LOMOND WINE 75 CL BTL 272.8605
NO BID RECEIVED

ALLESVERLOREN WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
SAMSARA WINE 75 CL BTL 290
NO BID RECEIVED

MOUTON CADET WINE 75 CL BTL 325.2315
HIGHEST BID 515 1st Bidder
MEDALLA REAL WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

ZONENBLOEM ASSORTED WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 301 1st Bidder
PIERRO WINE 75 CL BTL 264.132
NO BID RECEIVED

FRONTERA WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

FAIRVIEW WINE 75 CL BTL 386.331
NO BID RECEIVED

DOUGLAS GREEN ASSORTED WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
NO BID RECEIVED

MICHEL LYNCH WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
NO BID RECEIVED

KWV SAUVIGNON BLANC 75 CL BTL 368.874
HIGHEST BID 401 1st Bidder
LAMOTTE ASSORTED WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
NO BID RECEIVED

HAUTE CABRIERE WINE 75 CL BTL 351.417
HIGHEST BID 465 1st Bidder
RIDGE & VALE WINE 75 CL BTL 420
NO BID RECEIVED

BARTON & GUESTIER WINE 75 CL BTL 386.331
HIGHEST BID 390 1st Bidder
MALAZA WINE 75 CL BTL 264.132
HIGHEST BID 345 1st Bidder
EXCELSIOR WINE 75 CL BTL 264.132
NO BID RECEIVED

DURBANVILLE HILLS WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 200 1st Bidder
DELHEIM WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503




HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
MANOR HOUSE WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
RUSTENBERG WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
HIGHEST BID 340 1st Bidder
BEYERSKLOOF WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
NO BID RECEIVED

WATERFORD WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 301 1st Bidder
JACOBS CREEK WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

NETH LINGSHOF WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 300 1st Bidder
KWV SHIRAZ WINE 75 CL BTL 368.874
HIGHEST BID 381 1st Bidder
VIEUX MAGON WINE 75 CL BTL 264.132
HIGHEST BID 281 1st Bidder
RULANDSKE SEDE WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 316 1st Bidder
CHATEAU KIRWAN WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 519 1st Bidder
CHATEAU MEZAIN WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 321 1st Bidder
DIEMERSFONTEIN WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
NO BID RECEIVED

DOMAINE DUBOSC WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
BARON DE RICHEMONT WINE 75 CL BTL 342.6885
HIGHEST BID 400 1st Bidder
GEYSER PEAK WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046
NO BID RECEIVED

KANU WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

OLD BOYS 21 WINE BTL 299.046
HIGHEST BID 326 1st Bidder
PLAISIR DE MERLE WINE 75 CL BTL 264.132
CONO SUR WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
HIGHEST BID 355 1st Bidder
KEN FORESTER WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

LA COLONIA WINE 75 CL BTL 281.589
NO BID RECEIVED

RIVENDALE ASSORTED WINE 75 CL BTL 299.046




HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
SIMONSIG WINE 75 CL BTL 316.503
NO BID RECEIVED

CHAMPAGNE CHARPENTIER 75 CL BTL 1465
NO BID RECEIVED

LOT OF 3 BOTTLES X 75 CL -LES FLEURS DE MONTBLANC LOT 300
(PLASTIC BTL)

HIGHEST BID 501 1st Bidder
MOET & CHANDON CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 2331
NO BID RECEIVED

TAMASSA SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 108
HIGHEST BID 128 1st Bidder
BOLLINGER CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1465
NO BID RECEIVED

DUVAL LEROY CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 1465
NO BID RECEIVED

NEDERBURG SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 398
NO BID RECEIVED

VILLIERA TRADITION SPARKLING WINE 75 CL BTL 398
HIGHEST BID 401 1st Bidder
COCKBURNS WINE 100 CL BTL 299
HIGHEST BID 655 1st Bidder
KLEINZALZE WINE 75 CL BTL 299
NO BID RECEIVED

MEERLUST WINE 75 CL BTL 299
NO BID RECEIVED

THOLOMIES WINE 75 CL BTL 333
NO BID RECEIVED

CHATEAU ROMEFORT BTL 299
HIGHEST BID 326 1st Bidder
EAGLES’ NEST WINE 75 CL BTL 299
HIGHEST BID 321 1st Bidder
HENRIOT CHAMPAGNE 37.5 CL BTL 285
HIGHEST BID 315 1st Bidder
SARGET WINE 75 CL BTL 333
NO BID RECEIVED

LOUIS LATOUR WINE 75 CL BTL 355
HIGHEST BID 521 1st Bidder
FRANSCHHOEK CELIAR WINE 75 CL BTL 398
NO BID RECEIVED

SAN ANGELO WINE 75 CL BTL 311

NO BID RECEIVED




DAVID NIEUWOUDT WINE 75 CL BTL 333
NO BID RECEIVED

CENTINE WINE 75 CL BTL 311
NO BID RECEIVED

BORDEAUX WINE 75 CL BTL 333
HIGHEST BID 401 1st Bidder
KOONUNGA HILL WINE 375 ML BTL 122
HIGHEST BID 145 1st Bidder
EUREKA WINE 75 CL BTL 60
HIGHEST BID 78 1st Bidder
CAPE WINE 75 CL BTL 220
HIGHEST BID 305 1st Bidder
BORDOFINN WINE 75 CL BTL 60
HIGHEST BID 78 1st Bidder
LA MOTTE WINE 75 CL BTL 280
NO BID RECEIVED

JOSEPH DROUHIN WINE 75 CL BTL 280
HIGHEST BID 491 1st Bidder
DELHEIM ROSE WINE 75 CL BTL 260
HIGHEST BID 281 1st Bidder
YVES BAZIN BOURGOGNE 75 CL BTL 260
HIGHEST BID 281 1st Bidder
MARIE BRIZARD 100 CL BTL 341
HIGHEST BID 405 1st Bidder
CHARLES LAFITTE CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 777
HIGHEST BID 798 1st Bidder
CHAMPAGNE MOUTARD 75 CL BTL 777
HIGHEST BID 798 1st Bidder
HEIDSICK CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 930
NO BID RECEIVED

DROSTDY HOF 375 ML BTL 80
HIGHEST BID 165 1st Bidder
CHAMPAGNE COUVENT FILS 75 CL BTL 777
HIGHEST BID 798 1st Bidder
DELAMOTTE CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 777
HIGHEST BID 1590 1st Bidder
CAPELEAF WINE 75 CL BTL 178
HIGHEST BID 201 1st Bidder
DE CASTELANNE CHAMPAGNE 75 CL BTL 777
HIGHEST BID 798 1st Bidder
RHUM CAFE VANILLE 500 ML BTL 142
HIGHEST BID 201 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 CHAMPY NON ALCOHOLIC 75 CL LOT 180




NO BID RECEIVED

LOT OF 2 CHAMDOR NON ALCOHOLIC 75 CL BTL 120
NO BID RECEIVED

JAMARI RED RESERVE WINE 75 CL - CTN OF 12 CTNS 1564
HIGHEST BID 2102 1st Bidder
IZARRA RED RESERVE WINE 75 CL - CTN OF 12 CTNS 1555
HIGHEST BID 2104 1st Bidder
IZARRA WHITE WINE 75 CL - CTN OF 6 CTN 772
HIGHEST BID 2100 1st Bidder
LOT OF 40 GRANITE CERAMIC RODS - SLIGHTLY SCRATCHED LorTr 2745.6
HIGHEST BID 3000 1st Bidder
CHURIDAR PC 128.7
HIGHEST BID 400 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 PLASTIC MOULD LorTr 411.84
HIGHEST BID 511 1st Bidder
1 STABILIZER LINK + 1 RACK END LorTr 386.1
HIGHEST BID 501 1st Bidder
10 CYLINDER GASKET + 1 GASKET SET LorTr 2831.4
HIGHEST BID 3050 1st Bidder
FOG SUPPORT-PLASTIC PR 343.2
HIGHEST BID 550 1st Bidder
CABLE CLUTCH PC 257.4
HIGHEST BID 350 1st Bidder
M/V WATER PUMP PC 772.2
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 8 PLASTIC TOY WHEELS LoT 274.56
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
LOT OF 34 CLAMPS FOR GLASS SHELVE LoT 2574
HIGHEST BID 3050 1st Bidder
LOT OF 40 PCS OF RUBBER BUSH LoT 171.6
HIGHEST BID 200 1st Bidder
STAINLESS FUSHIA PR 85.8
HIGHEST BID 100 1st Bidder
1 MAIN MODULE APEX BP SOLAR(BLANK) + 10 CIRCUIT LoTr 3946.8
CONNECTORS

HIGHEST BID 4200 1st Bidder
LOT OF 24 CANS TURBO OIL 946ML LoTr 1647.36
HIGHEST BID 2300 1st Bidder
PRESSURE ACTUATED WATER REGULATING VALVE PC 5714.8
HIGHEST BID 800 1st Bidder
LOT OF 104 BOTTLES PARAFFIN OIL LOoT 892.32
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 30 NIPPLES LOoT 411.84




HIGHEST BID 562 1st Bidder
1LOT: LOT 2402.4
HIGHEST BID 2500 1st Bidder
LOT OF 12 WATER FILTER CARTRIDGES BWT LOT 3294.72
HIGHEST BID 100 BELOW RP
LOT OF 3 PCS MACHINERY SPARE PARTS LoOT 2574
FUEL TANK-HARLEY DAVIDSON PC 772.2
HIGHEST BID 3000 1st Bidder
LOT 3 PCS OF LIGHTING FIXTURES LOT 394.02
HIGHEST BID 1200 1st Bidder
TEXTILE RIBBON PK 85.8
HIGHEST BID 100 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 SPORTS BAGS LOT 131.34
HIGHEST BID 358 1st Bidder
LOT OF 5 PCS BIKINI LOT 429
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 100 KEY RINGS LOT 858
HIGHEST BID 1502 1st Bidder
LOT OF 10 THERMOMUG LOT 858
HIGHEST BID 1215 1st Bidder
LOT OF 10 PURSES LOT 394.02
HIGHEST BID 2001 1st Bidder
LOT OF 20 ASS. CARD HOLDERS LOT 788.04
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
W/STOLE PC 171.6
MOUSSER (STOLE) PC 171.6
SILK MOUSSELINE (SHAWL) PC 343.2
HIGHEST BID 405 1st Bidder
W/CSH (SHAWL) PC 257.4
HIGHEST BID 360 1st Bidder
LOT OF 7 PURSES LOT 551.628
HIGHEST BID 1811 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 WATCH - LIMIT LOT 514.8
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
SET BRACELET + EARING - MARTIN JAMES SET 257.4
HIGHEST BID 705 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 ASS. SAREE LOT 514.8
HIGHEST BID 925 1st Bidder
RUG PC 343.2
HIGHEST BID 350 1st Bidder
DRESS PC 123.75
HIGHEST BID 125 1st Bidder
BEDSHEET PC 131.34
HIGHEST BID 330 1st Bidder




LOT OF 5 KIDS SHORTS LOoT 361.35
HIGHEST BID 461 1st Bidder
LOT OF 28 KIDS T/SHIRTS LOoT 1492.26
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
LOT OF 6 PRS SOCKS LOoT 42.9
HIGHEST BID 719 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 HATS LoT 137.28
HIGHEST BID 301 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 RED T/SHIRTS LoT 216.81
HIGHEST BID 348 1st Bidder
LOT OF 5 ASS. LUNG/ LoT 429
HIGHEST BID 450 1st Bidder
LOT OF 6 SHAWLS LoT 5714.8
HIGHEST BID 608 1st Bidder
GREEN SANDAL PR 77.22
HIGHEST BID 100 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 JEANS Lor 495
HIGHEST BID 625 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 TROUSERS Lor 106.59
HIGHEST BID 325 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 POLO SHIRTS Lor 123.75
HIGHEST BID 158 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 BELTS Lor 128.7
HIGHEST BID 338 1st Bidder
LOT OF 6 PRS SOCKS LoT 42.9
HIGHEST BID 306 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 T/'SHIRTS LoT 237.6
HIGHEST BID 401 1st Bidder
PURSE PC 65.67
HIGHEST BID 108 1st Bidder
PETTY VEST PC 10
HIGHEST BID 25 1st Bidder
BLACK JEANS PC 123.75
HIGHEST BID 158 1st Bidder
SHIRT PC 106.59
HIGHEST BID 128 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 TABLE CLOTH Lor 131.34
HIGHEST BID 150 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 SHORTS/2BOXER Lor 178.86
HIGHEST BID 226 1st Bidder
LOT OF 30 CHURIDARS Lor 3861
HIGHEST BID 8009 1st Bidder
LOT 50 PKG X 100 PCS ELASTIC HAIR BAND Lor 1287
HIGHEST BID 5090 1st Bidder




LOT OF 56 PK ASSORTED HAIR CLIPS LOoT 960.96
HIGHEST BID 1700 1st Bidder
1 LOT 12 X 9000 TINY PLASTIC DECORATIVE BEADS LOoT 5148
HIGHEST BID 6000 1st Bidder
USED SLEEPING BAG PC 858
HIGHEST BID 1180 1st Bidder
WORKING SUIT (OVERALL) PC 171.6
HIGHEST BID 272 1st Bidder
SAFETY BOOTS PR 5714.8
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
LOT OF 28 PRS LADIES CHAMPALS LoT 2162.16
HIGHEST BID 2800 1st Bidder
LADY SHOES PR 77.22
HIGHEST BID 201 1st Bidder
MEN SHOES PR 77.22
HIGHEST BID 350 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 TOPS Lor 68.64
HIGHEST BID 118 1st Bidder
USED WATCH LIMIT (KNOB BROKEN) PC 161.7
HIGHEST BID 750 1st Bidder
USED WATCH SWISS MILITARY PC 823.68
HIGHEST BID 1620 1st Bidder
BEAUTY BOOSTER CREAM - GUERLAIN PC 450
HIGHEST BID 650 1st Bidder
MAXIMISER CREAM PC 343
HIGHEST BID 350 1st Bidder
SHISHEIDO EMULSION 300 ML PC 686.4
HIGHEST BID 711 1st Bidder
SHISHEIDO LOTION 100 ML PC 514.8
HIGHEST BID 611 1st Bidder
YSL PERFUME 6 CL PC 514.8
HIGHEST BID 1600 1st Bidder
JACOBS PERFUME 5 CL PC 343.2
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
CREAM NO 7 PC 257.4
HIGHEST BID 200 BELOW RP
LANCOME PERFUME SET SET 686.4
HIGHEST BID 1600 1st Bidder
PAUL SMITH -PORTRAIT FOR WOMEN 80 ML PC 514.8
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
PAUL SMITH -PORTRAIT FOR MEN 80 ML PC 514.8
HIGHEST BID 805 1st Bidder
DEODORANT STICK VERSACE 75 ML PC 514.8
HIGHEST BID 725 1st Bidder




EAU DE PARFUM DIOR 150 ML PC 772.2
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
NIVEA EXPERT LIFT 50 ML PC 343.2
HIGHEST BID 410 1st Bidder
NIVEA Q 10 50 ML PC 223.08
HIGHEST BID 320 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 LOREAL CREAM AGE PERFECT 50 ML LoT 686.4
HIGHEST BID 850 1st Bidder
BURBERRY BODY 60 ML PC 411.84
HIGHEST BID 850 1st Bidder
CLINIQUE CREME VISAGE 50 ML PC 583.44
HIGHEST BID 600 1st Bidder
BIOTHERME LAIT CORPOREL 200 ML PC 231.66
HIGHEST BID 265 1st Bidder
CLINIQUE MASCARA 6 ML Lor 240.24
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
AFTER SHAVE BALM BLEU DE CHANEL 9 CL PC 583.44
HIGHEST BID 1275 1st Bidder
17 PR MARCHON MEDIGEL PR 429
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
1 LOT OF : Lor 386
HIGHEST BID 760 1st Bidder
LOT OF 400 PLAQUETTE SILICONE + 100 VIS FOR SPECTACLE Lor 858
FRAMES
HIGHEST BID 1750 1st Bidder
USED MOUSE - 35W PC 42.9
HIGHEST BID 100 1st Bidder
SET : WATCH + TORCH + BELT + PEN SET 858
HIGHEST BID 3111 1st Bidder
DIGITAL PHOTO FRAME + ACCESSORIES PC 1287
HIGHEST BID 1800 1st Bidder
WIRELESS MOUSE PC 135
HIGHEST BID 511 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 CALCULATORS Lor 343.2
HIGHEST BID 352 1st Bidder
MULTI SOCKET PC 34.32
HIGHEST BID 111 1st Bidder
DIGITAL SAMSUNG CAMERA CD NXII PCSs 4461.6
HIGHEST BID 14600 1st Bidder
DIGITAL CAMERA SAMSUNG ES90 PCSs 1716
HIGHEST BID 10917 1st Bidder
2 PCS OF CABLE(SPARE KIT ADAPTOR) Lor 85.8
HIGHEST BID 116 1st Bidder
LOT OF 9 HDMI CABLES / ADAPTERS Lor 772.2




HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
1 CPU + 1 MOUSE + 1 KEYBOARD + 1 CABLE + 24 USB Lor 3432
CABLES

HIGHEST BID 8000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 PCS OF POWER CABLE FOR PC Lor 77.22
HIGHEST BID 111 1st Bidder
6 REMOTE CONTROLS (SAMSUNG) + PARTS LorTr 1716
HIGHEST BID 1716 1st Bidder
LOT OF 3 USED/INCOMPLETE SERVER DELL Lor 2574
HIGHEST BID 8000 1st Bidder
USED CAMERA STAND PC 120.12
HIGHEST BID 800 1st Bidder
USED BOSE HEADSET PC 2745.6
HIGHEST BID 3000 1st Bidder
WATCH NIKE PC 858
HIGHEST BID 1892 1st Bidder
WATCH CIELO PC 858
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
BRACELET PC 85.8
HIGHEST BID 260 1st Bidder
BAG TINTAMAR PC 42.9
HIGHEST BID 100 1st Bidder
USED i PAD BOARD -BEOPLAY PC 858
HIGHEST BID 900 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 USED i POD LoT 1372.8
HIGHEST BID 2111 1st Bidder
USED BOSE HEADSET PC 2745.6
HIGHEST BID 4722 1st Bidder
USED PEECKTON DVD PLAYER PC 1029.6
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
USED HEAD PHONE - ULTRA SONE PC 188.76
HIGHEST BID 850 1st Bidder
USED SONY HANDYCAM CASETTE VIDEO CAMERA PC 1030
HIGHEST BID 2104 1st Bidder
USED NINTENDO W/O ACCS / DAMAGED LoTr 686.4
HIGHEST BID 692 1st Bidder
USED i POD + 2 EARPHONE + 1 HEADPHONE LoTr 858
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
1L0T: LoTr 2231
HIGHEST BID 3901 1st Bidder
USED PORTABLE DVD PLAYER SONY W/O AcCCs. PC 858
HIGHEST BID 1653 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 CCTV VIDEO CAMERA LOoT 2059.2
HIGHEST BID 3420 1st Bidder




HAIR CLIPPER + ACCESSORIES SET 429
HIGHEST BID 1015 1st Bidder
USED i POD 4GB + EARPHONE PC 5714.8
HIGHEST BID 700 1st Bidder
USED NINTENDO DS W/O ACCS PC 686.4
HIGHEST BID 704 1st Bidder
USED i POD W/O ACCS PC 485
HIGHEST BID 825 1st Bidder
USED i POD W/O ACCS PC 640
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
USED KINDLE BOOK W/O AcCcs PC 763.62
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
USED AMAZON KINDLE - W/O AcCS PC 763.62
HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
USED HEADSET PC 188.76
HIGHEST BID 311 1st Bidder
USED i POD PC 640
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
USED PORTABLE DVD D/JIX + HEADPHONE Lor 1287
HIGHEST BID 2300 1st Bidder
HANDYCAM SONY PC 2574
HIGHEST BID 5500 1st Bidder
USED HEADPHONE PC 171.6
HIGHEST BID 180 1st Bidder
USED CAMERA LUMIX PC 1029.6
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
USED CAMERA NIKON D3100 PC 1029.6
HIGHEST BID 9000 1st Bidder
USED DIGITAL CAMERA SONY PC 1029.6
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
USED E READER KOBO W/0 AcCCs. PC 514.8
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
USED i POD APPLE 160 GB W EARPHONE PC 772.2
HIGHEST BID 2200 1st Bidder
USED i POD W/O AcCS PC 686.4
HIGHEST BID 1300 1st Bidder
USED PRINTER EPSON W/O ACCESSORIES PC 858
HIGHEST BID 1101 1st Bidder
USED SONY CYBERSHOT CAMERA PC 943.8
HIGHEST BID 2200 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 USED HARD DISC SEAGATE 160 GB Lor 858
HIGHEST BID 1139 1st Bidder
USED i POD + CHARGER PC 772.2
HIGHEST BID 2200 1st Bidder




USED NINTENDO W/O AcCS PC 686.4
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
USED CAMCORDER CANNON PC 1973.4
HIGHEST BID 6319 1st Bidder
USED CAMERA LUMIX PC 1029.6
HIGHEST BID 2100 1st Bidder
USED DIGITAL CAMERA SONY CYBERSHOT W/O ACCS PC 1201.2
HIGHEST BID 1800 1st Bidder
USED CAMERA FINEPIX 5600 PC 1029.6
HIGHEST BID 4123 1st Bidder
USED SONY HANDYCAM CMOS PC 2574
HIGHEST BID 7524 1st Bidder
USED DIGITAL CAMERA OLYMPUS W/O ACCS PC 755.04
HIGHEST BID 4750 1st Bidder
USED HEADPHONE BOSE PC 2745.6
HIGHEST BID 7256 1st Bidder
LOT OF : Lor 2059.2
HIGHEST BID 3000 1st Bidder
SET OF 2 OPERATOR MANUAL FOR VOLVO EQUIPMENT Lor 171.6
HIGHEST BID 300 1st Bidder
SET OF 2 BOOKS ON MANAGERIAL BEHAVIOUR / BTEC SETS 514.8
HIGHER NATIONAL IN BUSINESS

HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
BOOK "PHILOSOPHY - A SCHOOL OF FREEDOM"”" PCSs 171.6
HIGHEST BID 300 1st Bidder
SET USED KID BOOK + CD MON IMAGE SONORE SET 50
HIGHEST BID 111 1st Bidder
LA DANSE + LA MARCHE DE L'EMPEREUR - 2 DVD Lor 171.6
HIGHEST BID 200 1st Bidder
LADY WATCH TITAN PC 468
HIGHEST BID 1001 1st Bidder
LOT OF 5 SOFTWARE OF IMEA PRODUCTS SECURITY Lor 858
HIGHEST BID 599 BELOW RP
CLASSEUR PC 42.9
HIGHEST BID 75 1st Bidder
USED / SCRATCHED GUITAR PC 429
HIGHEST BID 709 1st Bidder
USED SQUASH RACKET PC 600.6
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
GRINDER MOULINEX PC 429
HIGHEST BID 1201 1st Bidder
BABY CAR SEAT PC 788.04
HIGHEST BID 1100 1st Bidder
LOT OF 133 PLASTIC CANS Lor 114.114




HIGHEST BID 200 1st Bidder
LOT OF 102 CTNS X 6 EMPTY PLASTIC BOTTLES WITHOUT Lor 1050.192
CAPS

HIGHEST BID 1500 1st Bidder
PORTABLE BABY SWING PC 525.36
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
ART WORK PC 5714.8
HIGHEST BID 745 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 SOUVENIR PLATE Lor 85.8
HIGHEST BID 650 1st Bidder
LOT OF 12 DODO SOUVENIR Lor 5714.8
HIGHEST BID 635 1st Bidder
CARPET PC 686.4
HIGHEST BID 1101 1st Bidder
LOT OF 4 ELEPHANT STATUES LorTr 343.2
HIGHEST BID 401 1st Bidder
LOT OF 2 RELIGIOUS HANGING RUGS LorTr 343
HIGHEST BID 810 1st Bidder
2 X-MINI SPEAKERS Lor 172
HIGHEST BID 800 1st Bidder
PAINTING PC 172
HIGHEST BID 400 1st Bidder
LOT OF 14 CABLES (NETCOM CORD) Lor 105
HIGHEST BID 200 1st Bidder
LOT OF 5 ROLLING PIN LoT 320
HIGHEST BID 4000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 10 FRY SHOVEL LoT 191
HIGHEST BID 1091 1st Bidder
LOT OF 8 WINE BOTTLE HOLDER LoT 576
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 5 SIFTER LoT 3395
HIGHEST BID 5000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 288 COFFEE cUPS LoTr 1846
HIGHEST BID 4500 1st Bidder
LOT OF 168 WINE GLASS LoTr 16710
HIGHEST BID 4000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 5 FRYING PAN LoTr 798
HIGHEST BID 4000 1st Bidder
LOT 10 RUSTY WOK LoTr 1596
HIGHEST BID 4000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 46 MOUSE LoTr 517
HIGHEST BID 2715 1st Bidder
LOT OF 15 DRAP HOUSSE LOoT 480
HIGHEST BID 1100 1st Bidder




LOT OF 234 TOPS LOoT 10135
HIGHEST BID 5000 BELOW RP
LOT OF 9 KIDS DRESSES LOoT 390
HIGHEST BID 500 1st Bidder
LOT OF 10 IGNITION COIL LOoT 525
HIGHEST BID 700 1st Bidder
LOT OF 44 FLASH DRIVE LoT 656
HIGHEST BID 2000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 100 SPECTACLES LoT 2500
HIGHEST BID 3725 1st Bidder
LOT OF 125 SPECTACLES LoT 3125
HIGHEST BID 4000 1st Bidder
LOT OF 1 PANT + 1 DRESS + 1 BLOUSE + 1 PYJAMA + 3 PRS LoT 193
SANDALS + 1 SET BRACELET + 1 SWIMWEAR
HIGHEST BID 488 1st Bidder
SPARE PARTS SET 742
HIGHEST BID 742 1st Bidder
SET OF 5 MINIATURE CARS SET 75
HIGHEST BID 150 1st Bidder
1 SAREE PC 150
HIGHEST BID 250 1st Bidder
AMAZON KINDLE PC 200
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
AMAZON KINDLE PC 200
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
DVD DYNASTY SET 150
HIGHEST BID 161 1st Bidder
DVD MON VOISIN TOTORO PC 30
HIGHEST BID 50 1st Bidder
2 HARD DISK LoT 600
HIGHEST BID 1255 1st Bidder
USED AMAZON KINDLE - W/O AcCS PC 300
HIGHEST BID 1000 1st Bidder
45 ASSORTED music cb Lor 506
HIGHEST BID 658 1st Bidder
RICE COOKER PC 200
HIGHEST BID 388 1st Bidder
REAR BOOT LIGHT COVER PC 150
HIGHEST BID 175 1st Bidder
REAR LAMP PR 300
HIGHEST BID 320 1st Bidder
SAMSUNG MP3 PLAYER USED W/O ACCESSORIES PC 90
HIGHEST BID 110 1st Bidder
HAT PC 15




HIGHEST BID 160 1st Bidder

HIGHEST BID 1st Bidder

HIGHEST BID 1st Bidder

HIGHEST BID 215 1st Bidder




